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Associate Professor of economics with expertise in the design and implementation of tax policy.

Biography
Lindsay holds a BA in Political Science from Carleton University, a BA and MA in Economics from 
the University of Victoria, and a PhD in Economics from McMaster University. Lindsay has previously 
held a faculty appointment at the University of Manitoba and was more recently a Visiting Professor 
at the School of Public Policy at the University of Calgary. Lindsay is a specialist in applied economic 
research and policy analysis, with a particular focus on the design and implementation of tax policy. 
Her work spans a number of topics including the underground economy, income underreporting, the 
tax treatments of stock options, the second-hand economy, user fees, insider disclosure, and birth 
seasonality. She is the co-author of two books and has published a number of book chapters, 
technical reports, interactive guides, and papers in peer reviewed journals. Lindsay is a regular non-
partisan public commentator, writing for print media, appearing on a variety of T.V., radio, and 
podcasts, and providing testimony to the House of Commons Finance Committee. She is a member 
of the research advisory board for the Northern Policy Institute and a member of the editorial Board 
for the Mowat Centre. Before becoming an academic, Lindsay held several non-partisan posts with 
the Government of Canada in Ottawa as well as in municipal government in the areas of public 
economics and policy implementation.

Industry Expertise
Public Policy, Program Development, Research, Education/Learning

Areas of Expertise
Economics and Public Policy, Tax, Tax and Budget Policy, Tax Policy, Tax Credits, Tax Deductions, 
Tax Avoidance, Underground Economy, Second-hand Economy, User Fees, Stock Options, 
Guaranteed Annual Income, Public Administration

Affiliations
Research Fellow School of Public Policy University of Calgary, Member Editorial Board The Mowat 
Centre, Member Research Advisory Board Northern Policy Institute, Associate Professor Department 
of Economics University of Victoria

Education

McMaster University
PhD Economics
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University of Victoria
M.A. Economics

University of Victoria
B.A. (with Distinction) Economics

Carleton University
B.A. (with Honours) Political Science
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